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STATE-LICENSURE-DIRECTORY

Alabama NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

https://www.alsde.edu/sec/ec/Pages/outofstatecertificates-all.aspx

Alaska NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

https://education.alaska.gov/teachercertification/certification/initial#OutOfSta
te

Arizona NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

https://www.azed.gov/educator-certification/forms-and-
information/reciprocity/

Arkansas NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

http://dese.ade.arkansas.gov/divisions/educator%20effectiveness/educator-
licensure/licensure-by-reciprocity

California NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none
https://www.ctc.ca.gov/credentials/out-of-state-
app?TSPD_101_R0=084e6f7cb6ab2000033894830d732e5f9966472a649c77291
d2148969fd5ac1d00cfafb88ab1bf6f0823ed278e14300008b8c912c7c7c70cdbbb
3a68be9cdb14ccd40258d7dc9299027d7f5f58e9e780530abebc4cd7aae7e3fec1
6ab3cd8a30

Colorado NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

https://www.cde.state.co.us/cdeprof/outofstateteacher

Connecticut NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

https://portal.ct.gov/SDE/Certification/Out-of-State-Educators

Delaware NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

https://www.doe.k12.de.us/Page/3504

Florida NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

http://www.fldoe.org/teaching/certification/pathways-routes/certified-teacher-
or-administrator.stml

Georgia NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

https://www.gapsc.com/Certification/Home.aspx

Hawaii NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

http://www.hawaiipublicschools.org/ConnectWithUs/Employment/LicensureA
ndCertification/Pages/home.aspx



Idaho NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

https://www.sde.idaho.gov/cert-psc/cert/apply/out-of-state.html

Illinois NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

https://www.isbe.net/Pages/Educator-Licensure.aspx

Indiana NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

https://www.doe.in.gov/licensing/teacher#OutState

Iowa NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

https://www.boee.iowa.gov

Kentucky NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

http://www.epsb.ky.gov/mod/page/view.php?id=30

Louisiana NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

https://www.teachlouisiana.net/Teachers.aspx?PageID=650

Maine NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

https://www.maine.gov/doe/cert/

Maryland NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

http://marylandpublicschools.org/about/Pages/DEE/Certification/apply/Out-of-
State-Certificate.aspx

Massachusetts NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

http://www.doe.mass.edu/licensure/

Michigan NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

https://www.michigan.gov/documents/mde/Out_Of_State_Applicants_534635
_7.pdf

Minnesota NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

https://mn.gov/pelsb/aspiring-educators/requirements/

Mississippi NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

https://www.mdek12.org/OTL/OEL/Reciprocity



Missouri NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

https://dese.mo.gov/educator-quality/certification

Montana NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

http://opi.mt.gov/Educators/Licensure/Educator-Licensure

Nebraska NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

https://www.education.ne.gov/tcert/

Nevada NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

http://www.doe.nv.gov/Educator_Licensure/New_Teachers_Out_of_State_App
licants/

New Hampshire NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

https://www.education.nh.gov/who-we-are/division-of-educator-support-and-
higher-education/bureau-of-credentialing

New Jersey NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

https://nj.gov/education/license/out/reciprocity.htm

New Mexico NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

https://webnew.ped.state.nm.us/bureaus/licensure/

New York NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

http://www.highered.nysed.gov/tcert/certificate/teachrecother.html

North Carolina NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

https://www.education.nh.gov/who-we-are/division-of-educator-support-and-
higher-education/bureau-of-credentialing

North Dakota NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

https://nj.gov/education/license/out/reciprocity.htm

Ohio NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

https://webnew.ped.state.nm.us/bureaus/licensure/

Oklahoma NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

http://www.highered.nysed.gov/tcert/certificate/teachrecother.html



Oregon NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

https://www.oregon.gov/tspc/LIC/Pages/Out-of-State.aspx

Pennsylvania NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

https://www.education.pa.gov/Educators/Certification/OutOfState/Pages/Com
pleted-Approved-Preparation-Program-Outside-of-Pennsylvania.aspx

Rhode Island NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

https://www.ride.ri.gov/TeachersAdministrators/EducatorCertification/RIEduca
torPreparationPrograms.aspx#12581-ri-approved-programs

South Carolina NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

https://ed.sc.gov/educators/teaching-in-south-carolina/reciprocity/

South Dakota NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

https://doe.sd.gov/certification/documents/RECIPROCITY-%20ED.pdf

Tennessee NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

https://www.tn.gov/education/licensing/educator-licensure/out-of-state-
educators.html

Texas NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

https://tea.texas.gov/texas-educators/certification/out-of-state-
certification/out-of-state-certified-educators

Utah NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

https://www.schools.utah.gov/curr/licensing/earning?mid=2465&aid=7

Vermont NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

https://education.vermont.gov/educator-licensure/become-a-vermont-
educator

Virginia NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

http://www.doe.virginia.gov/teaching/licensure/info_out-of-
state_online_programs.pdf

Washington NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

https://www.k12.wa.us/certification/teacher-certificate/out-state-applicants-
teachers

West Virginia NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

https://wvde.state.wv.us/certification/forms/reciprocity.html



Wisconsin NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

https://dpi.wi.gov/licensing/pathways-licensure/oos-pathways#Out-of-
State%20Pathway

Wyoming NO
MED READ, 
READ CERT

Successful completion of the MED, Reading Specialist degree program or 
Reading Specialist certificate program at MNU will qualify students to sit for 
the appropriate Paxis exam(s) in Kansas. Students with a professional Kansas 
teaching license may attach the advanced licensure to their Kansas license. 
Students without a Kansas license may choose to complete the program 
without pursuing the licensure component. 

none

https://wyomingptsb.com/licensure/out-of-state-applicants/


